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FREEDOM FROM ANXIETY  
What you need to know to take 

control over your life today 



INTRODUCCION 

We've all experienced anxiety to a greater or lesser degree at some point in our 
lives. Anxiety is a feeling of fear about something that might happen in the future. 
If we think about it, we actually have little control over almost everything: the 
economy, the weather, traffic, what other people think or do, etc. However, we do 
have control, or at least we can learn to have control over the most important 
things: our thoughts, emotions, and reactions to what happens around us. 

My job is to teach people to take control of themselves. In the battle between the 
subconscious and the conscious mind, who do you think would win? The 
subconscious, of course. Since one of the purposes of the subconscious is to help 
us survive and protect us from danger. It warns us that we have to run to escape 
danger or prepare to fight and defend our lives. This is what our ancestors did when 
facing wild animals, wars, or natural disasters. Nowadays, we no longer have to 
face such dangers where our lives would be at risk, however, we inherited that 
reaction from our ancestors and now interpret everyday life situations as life-or-
death situations. That's the problem, the misinterpretation of those situations. Part 
of what I do is to get to the root of the problem, to the origin of that bad habit 
which is anxiety, solve it, and heal experiences, change thoughts to develop the 
habit of being able to interpret situations for what they really are. 

Anxiety is increasing for many reasons: too much technology, excessive 
information, less real communication, and more time on social networks which 
leads to comparisons with others and trying to reach often unattainable standards, 
a planet suffering from the effects of pollution and deforestation, etc. Anxiety is 
the malaise of modern times. One of my greatest satisfactions is being able to help 
someone suffering from anxiety regain control over their thoughts and emotions. 
Anxiety is not something one chooses to feel. It's an automatic thing that takes over 
the life of the person who suffers from it. But it's just that, an automatic habit, 
which can be eliminated and changed, since no one is born with anxiety. 

I hope this book helps you and inspires you to take action to change and improve 
your life. Let's begin... 

 

 



Chapter 1: Understanding Anxiety 

Anxiety is a complex and multifaceted emotion that affects millions of people 
worldwide. In this chapter, we will explore the different aspects of anxiety, 
including its definition, the different types, and the common symptoms that people 
may experience. 

Defining Anxiety 

Anxiety goes beyond simply feeling stressed or worried; it is a persistent and 
excessive fear or apprehension about everyday situations. While it is normal to 
experience anxiety occasionally, such as before an important event or during times 
of uncertainty, anxiety disorders involve intense and prolonged feelings of fear and 
worry that can interfere with daily life. 

Types of Anxiety Disorders 

Anxiety disorders encompass a variety of conditions, each with its own set of 
symptoms and triggers. Generalized Anxiety Disorder (GAD), Social Anxiety 
Disorder, Panic Disorder, and Specific Phobias are among the most common anxiety 
disorders. Understanding the differences between these disorders is crucial for 
effective treatment and management. 

Common Symptoms of Anxiety 

Anxiety can manifest in a variety of physical, emotional, and behavioral symptoms. 
Physical symptoms may include rapid heartbeat, sweating, trembling, and 
gastrointestinal problems. Emotional symptoms often involve feelings of 
apprehension, restlessness, irritability, and difficulty concentrating. Behavioral 
symptoms may include avoiding triggering situations, compulsive behaviors, 
harmful habits such as binge eating, drinking alcohol to relax, smoking, drug use, 
and difficulty sleeping. 

By recognizing the signs and symptoms of anxiety, people can take proactive steps 
to address their condition and seek the appropriate support. 

Write down your symptoms here and how anxiety is affecting your life: 

1.- 



2. 

3. 

4. 

5. 

Chapter 2: The Science Behind Anxiety 

Anxiety is not simply a product of one's imagination; it has a biological basis rooted 
in the intricate workings of the brain and body. In this chapter, we will explore the 
neuroscience behind anxiety, including the role of neurotransmitters, genetics, and 
environmental factors. 

Neurobiology of Anxiety 

Anxiety disorders are associated with alterations in brain chemistry and activity. 
The amygdala, hippocampus, and prefrontal cortex are key brain regions involved 
in the regulation of fear and anxiety responses. Dysregulation within these brain 
circuits can lead to heightened anxiety sensitivity and exaggerated threat 
perception. 

Role of Neurotransmitters 

Neurotransmitters, such as serotonin, dopamine, and norepinephrine, play a 
crucial role in modulating mood and anxiety levels. Imbalances in neurotransmitter 
levels have been implicated in the development and maintenance of anxiety 
disorders. Medications that target these neurotransmitter systems, such as 
selective serotonin reuptake inhibitors (SSRIs) and benzodiazepines, are commonly 
used in the treatment of anxiety. 

Genetics and Environmental Factors 

Anxiety disorders can have a genetic component, with certain genetic variations 
increasing susceptibility to anxiety. Additionally, environmental factors, such as 
childhood trauma, chronic stress, and substance abuse, can contribute to the 
development of anxiety disorders. Understanding the interplay between genetic 
predisposition and environmental influences is essential for comprehensively 



addressing anxiety. However, according to science, only about 5 to 10 percent of 
cases have a genetic component. This means that, most cases are caused by 
psychological reasons. In my practice, I tell my clients that even if they have a 
genetic predisposition to anxiety, their genes are not their destiny because it’s only 
a small part of the puzzle. Hypnosis can help effectively deal with the root of the 
problem, heal past experiences, eliminate negative thoughts and emotions while 
at the same time I help my clients increase optimism, inner peace and confidence. 
In some cases, anxiety is a learned behavior that people developed at a young age 
because they didn’t feel safe. Some of the causes for this can be demanding 
parents, absent parents, anxious parents that passed on this habit to their kids, 
overprotective parents, painful experiences like the loss of loved one at a young 
age, moving from city to city, bullying, etc. 

By gaining insights into the biological and psychological underpinnings of anxiety, 
individuals can appreciate that their symptoms are not their fault and can seek 
appropriate treatment and support tailored to their unique needs. 

 

Chapter 3: Cognitive Behavioral Techniques 

Cognitive-behavioral techniques offer practical strategies for identifying and 
challenging unhelpful thought patterns and behaviors associated with anxiety. In 
this chapter, we will explore various cognitive restructuring exercises and tools for 
managing anxious thoughts effectively. 

Understanding Cognitive Distortions 

Cognitive distortions, also known as irrational or unhelpful thinking patterns, 
contribute to feelings of anxiety and distress. Common cognitive distortions include 
catastrophizing, black-and-white thinking, and personalization. By learning to 
recognize and challenge these distortions, individuals can gain greater control over 
their anxiety. 

Cognitive Restructuring Exercises 



Cognitive restructuring involves replacing negative or distorted thoughts with more 
balanced and realistic ones. Techniques such as thought challenging, evidence 
gathering, and alternative thinking can help individuals reframe their perspective 
on anxiety-provoking situations. By actively challenging their negative beliefs, 
individuals can reduce the intensity of their anxiety responses. 

Thought Records and Journaling 

Thought records and journaling provide structured methods for tracking and 
analyzing one's thoughts and emotions. Keeping a thought diary allows individuals 
to identify patterns in their thinking, recognize triggers for anxiety, and monitor 
changes in their mood over time. By gaining insight into the underlying causes of 
their anxiety, individuals can develop more adaptive coping strategies. 

By incorporating cognitive-behavioral techniques into their daily routine, 
individuals can gradually rewire their thought patterns and reduce the impact of 
anxiety on their lives. 

 

Chapter 4: Relaxation Techniques 

Relaxation techniques offer powerful tools for calming the mind and body and 
reducing the physiological arousal associated with anxiety. In this chapter, we will 
explore various relaxation techniques, including deep breathing exercises, 
progressive muscle relaxation, and guided imagery. 

Deep Breathing Exercises 

Deep breathing exercises, also known as diaphragmatic breathing or belly 
breathing, involve slow, deliberate inhalation and exhalation through the nose or 
mouth. By focusing on the rhythm of their breath and engaging their diaphragm, 
individuals can activate the body's relaxation response and reduce feelings of 
anxiety and tension. 

Progressive Muscle Relaxation 



Progressive muscle relaxation involves systematically tensing and relaxing different 
muscle groups throughout the body. By alternating between tension and 
relaxation, individuals can release physical tension and promote a sense of deep 
relaxation. Regular practice of progressive muscle relaxation can help individuals 
become more attuned to their body's stress responses and learn to release tension 
more effectively. Check out my YouTube videos for relaxation and stress release: 
www.youtube.com/bilingualhypnotist 

www.youtube.com/FabiolaMiguelWellness 

 

Guided Imagery and Visualization 

Guided imagery and visualization techniques involve using mental imagery to evoke 
feelings of relaxation and well-being. By imagining peaceful scenes, such as a 
tranquil beach or a serene forest, individuals can create a sense of calmness and 
escape from anxious thoughts. Guided imagery scripts and audio recordings can 
provide structured guidance for individuals new to visualization techniques. 

By incorporating relaxation techniques into their daily routine, individuals can 
cultivate a greater sense of calm and resilience in the face of anxiety-provoking 
situations. 

Hypnosis and Hypnotherapy 

 Hypnosis is not mind control or what you may have seen in movies or tv shows. It’s 
actually a natural state that involves deep concentration and hyper suggestibility.  
Think of when you watch a movie and you feel emotions as if what you are watching 
is real. You know that they are actors and it’s not real, but your subconscious mind 
concentrates and follows the story, so it feels real to your subconscious. In this 
state, the mind is also more suggestible and we can communicate more easily with 
the subconscious. You don’t fall asleep or become unconscious during hypnosis. It 
feels as if you are falling asleep but your mind continues to concentrate on the 
hypnotist’s voice. For this reason, it’s a very useful holistic practice to change the 
programming in the subconscious mind and develop healthier habits and more 
beneficial thinking patterns that promote inner peace, relaxation, self-control, 
confidence in optimism. 

http://www.youtube.com/bilingualhypnotist
http://www.youtube.com/FabiolaMiguelWellness


Chapter 5: Mindfulness and Meditation 

Mindfulness and meditation practices offer powerful tools for cultivating present-
moment awareness and reducing anxiety. In this chapter, we will explore the 
principles of mindfulness, various mindfulness meditation practices, and how to 
incorporate mindfulness into daily life. 

Introduction to Mindfulness 

Mindfulness involves paying deliberate attention to the present moment without 
judgment. By focusing on the sensations of the breath, bodily sensations, or 
external stimuli, individuals can anchor themselves in the present and cultivate a 
sense of calmness and clarity. Mindfulness encourages acceptance of one's 
thoughts and emotions without becoming entangled in them. 

Mindfulness Meditation Practices 

Mindfulness meditation involves formal practices that cultivate present-moment 
awareness and nonjudgmental acceptance. Techniques such as mindful breathing 
meditation, body scan meditation, and loving-kindness meditation can help 
individuals develop greater self-awareness and compassion. Regular practice of 
mindfulness meditation can strengthen neural pathways associated with attention 
regulation and emotional resilience. 

Incorporating Mindfulness into Daily Life 

Mindfulness extends beyond formal meditation practices and can be integrated 
into various aspects of daily life. Simple activities such as mindful eating, mindful 
walking, and mindful listening can help individuals cultivate greater presence and 
awareness in their everyday experiences. By approaching each moment with 
curiosity and openness, individuals can reduce the grip of anxiety and find greater 
peace and contentment. 

By embracing mindfulness as a way of being, individuals can develop a more 
compassionate and accepting relationship with themselves and the world around 
them. 



In my practice, I incorporate mindfulness, deep breathing, guided imagery and 
positive suggestions to help people overcome anxiety. 

 

Chapter 6: Lifestyle Modifications 

Lifestyle modifications play a crucial role in managing anxiety and promoting 
overall well-being. In this chapter, we will explore the importance of sleep, 
nutrition, and exercise for mental health, as well as practical tips for incorporating 
healthy habits into daily life. 

Importance of Sleep 

Quality sleep is essential for maintaining optimal mental and emotional health. 
Sleep disturbances, such as insomnia or restless sleep, can exacerbate symptoms 
of anxiety and contribute to heightened stress levels. Implementing good sleep 
hygiene practices, such as maintaining a consistent sleep schedule, creating a 
relaxing bedtime routine, and optimizing the sleep environment, can promote 
restful and rejuvenating sleep. 

Balanced Nutrition for Mental Health 

Nutrition plays a significant role in supporting brain function and mood regulation. 
Diets rich in whole foods, such as fruits, vegetables, whole grains, and lean proteins, 
provide essential nutrients that support cognitive function and emotional well-
being. Conversely, diets high in processed foods, refined sugars, and unhealthy fats 
can negatively impact mood and increase susceptibility to anxiety. Adopting a 
balanced and nutritious diet can provide the foundation for mental and emotional 
resilience. 

Regular Exercise and its Impact on Anxiety 

Physical activity has been shown to have profound effects on mental health and 
well-being. Regular exercise can reduce symptoms of anxiety and depression by 
stimulating the release of endorphins, the body's natural mood-boosting 



chemicals. Exercise also helps regulate stress hormones, improve sleep quality, and 
enhance self-esteem and body image. Engaging in activities such as walking, 
jogging, swimming, or yoga can help individuals manage anxiety and improve 
overall quality of life. 

By prioritizing sleep, nutrition, and physical activity, individuals can create a 
supportive environment for managing anxiety and promoting mental and 
emotional wellness. 

 

Chapter 7: Stress Management Strategies 

Stress is a common trigger for anxiety, and learning effective stress management 
techniques can help individuals better cope with life's challenges. In this chapter, 
we will explore strategies for identifying and managing stressors, improving time 
management, and setting boundaries to protect mental health. 

Identifying Stressors 

Understanding the sources of stress in one's life is the first step toward effective 
stress management. Stressors can vary widely and may include work-related 
pressures, relationship conflicts, financial worries, or health concerns. By 
identifying specific stressors and their impact on physical and emotional well-being, 
individuals can develop targeted strategies for coping and resilience. 

Time Management Techniques 

Effective time management is essential for reducing feelings of overwhelm and 
increasing productivity and satisfaction. Techniques such as prioritization, goal 
setting, and breaking tasks into manageable steps can help individuals better 
organize their time and allocate resources efficiently. By establishing realistic 
deadlines and boundaries, individuals can reduce the likelihood of procrastination 
and alleviate stress. 

Setting Boundaries and Saying No 

Learning to set boundaries and assert one's needs is crucial for protecting mental 
health and well-being. Saying no to unreasonable demands or obligations can 



prevent burnout and resentment and preserve valuable time and energy for self-
care. By communicating assertively and respectfully, individuals can establish 
healthy boundaries in their personal and professional relationships and reduce 
feelings of guilt or obligation. 

By implementing stress management strategies, individuals can develop greater 
resilience and adaptability in the face of life's challenges, reducing the impact of 
stress on their mental and emotional well-being. 

 

Chapter 8: Social Support and Connection 

Social support plays a vital role in buffering against the negative effects of stress 
and promoting emotional well-being. In this chapter, we will explore the benefits 
of building supportive relationships, joining social groups, and seeking professional 
help when needed. 

Building Supportive Relationships 

Strong social connections provide a sense of belonging, acceptance, and validation, 
which are essential for emotional resilience. Cultivating deep, meaningful 
relationships with friends, family members, or peers can provide a valuable source 
of support during times of stress or anxiety. Regular communication, active 
listening, and reciprocity are key elements of nurturing supportive relationships. 

Joining Support Groups 

Support groups offer individuals facing similar challenges the opportunity to share 
experiences, offer encouragement, and receive validation and understanding. 
Whether online or in-person, support groups provide a safe and nonjudgmental 
space for individuals to express themselves openly and seek guidance and support 
from others who can relate to their experiences. Joining a support group can help 
reduce feelings of isolation and loneliness and foster a sense of connection and 
belonging. 



Seeking Professional Help 

In some cases, professional help may be necessary to address persistent or severe 
anxiety symptoms. Mental health professionals, such as therapists, hypnotists, 
counselors, or psychiatrists, can offer evidence-based treatments and 
interventions tailored to individual needs. Cognitive-behavioral therapy (CBT), 
Hypnotherapy, exposure therapy, medication, or other therapeutic approaches 
may be recommended based on the nature and severity of symptoms. Seeking 
professional help is a proactive step toward managing anxiety and improving 
overall quality of life. 

By nurturing supportive relationships, participating in social groups, and seeking 
professional help when needed, individuals can build a strong support network to 
help them navigate life's challenges and reduce feelings of anxiety and distress. 

Chapter 9: Overcoming Fear and Avoidance 

Fear and avoidance behaviors are common features of anxiety disorders, but they 
can also perpetuate the cycle of anxiety. In this chapter, we will explore exposure 
therapy, behavioral experiments, and acceptance-based strategies for confronting 
fears and breaking free from avoidance patterns. 

Exposure Therapy 

Exposure therapy is a highly effective treatment for anxiety disorders that involves 
gradually confronting feared situations or stimuli in a controlled and systematic 
manner. By exposing themselves to anxiety-provoking triggers in a safe 
environment, individuals can learn to tolerate and habituate to their fears over 
time. Exposure exercises may be conducted in vivo (real-life situations) or imaginal 
(imagined scenarios) and are tailored to each individual's specific fears and goals. 

Behavioral Experiments 

Behavioral experiments involve testing out unhelpful beliefs or predictions through 
direct observation and experimentation. By conducting behavioral experiments, 
individuals can gather evidence to challenge and modify their anxiety-related 
beliefs and assumptions. Behavioral experiments often involve stepping outside of 
one's comfort zone and testing out new behaviors or coping strategies in real-world 



situations. Through this process, individuals can gain a greater sense of mastery 
and confidence in their ability to cope with anxiety-provoking situations. 

Acceptance and Commitment Therapy (ACT) 

Acceptance and Commitment Therapy (ACT) is an evidence-based approach that 
emphasizes acceptance of uncomfortable thoughts and emotions while taking 
action aligned with one's values and goals. ACT techniques, such as mindfulness, 
cognitive diffusion, and values clarification, help individuals develop psychological 
flexibility and resilience in the face of anxiety. By learning to accept uncertainty and 
discomfort, individuals can reduce their struggle with anxiety and focus on living a 
meaningful and fulfilling life. 

By confronting fears and breaking free from avoidance patterns, individuals can 
reclaim their lives from the grip of anxiety and experience greater freedom and 
fulfillment. 

Chapter 10: Self-Compassion and Self-Care 

Self-compassion and self-care are essential components of mental and emotional 
well-being, especially for individuals struggling with anxiety. In this chapter, we will 
explore the concept of self-compassion, practical self-care activities, and strategies 
for cultivating a kind and nurturing relationship with oneself. 

Cultivating Self-Compassion 

Self-compassion involves treating oneself with kindness, understanding, and 
acceptance, especially in times of difficulty or suffering. Self-compassion entails 
acknowledging one's pain and struggles with warmth and empathy, rather than 
self-criticism or judgment. Practices such as self-kindness, common humanity, and 
mindfulness can help individuals cultivate greater self-compassion and resilience in 
the face of anxiety. 

Practicing Self-Care Activities 

Self-care activities involve intentionally engaging in behaviors that nurture and 
replenish one's physical, emotional, and spiritual well-being. Self-care practices 
may include activities such as taking a warm bath, practicing yoga or meditation, 



spending time in nature, or pursuing creative hobbies. By prioritizing self-care, 
individuals can recharge their energy reserves, reduce stress levels, and enhance 
their overall quality of life. 

Setting Realistic Expectations 

Setting realistic expectations for oneself is essential for maintaining mental and 
emotional balance and preventing burnout. It's important to recognize that no one 
is perfect, and it's okay to make mistakes or experience setbacks along the way. By 
setting realistic goals and expectations, individuals can avoid unnecessary pressure 
and self-criticism and foster a sense of self-acceptance and resilience. 

By practicing self-compassion, engaging in regular self-care activities, and setting 
realistic expectations, individuals can nurture a compassionate and supportive 
relationship with themselves, which is essential for managing anxiety and 
promoting overall well-being. 

Chapter 11: Finding Professional Help 

While self-help strategies can be beneficial, seeking professional help is often 
necessary for managing severe or persistent anxiety. In this chapter, we will explore 
the different types of mental health professionals, when to seek therapy, and 
approaches to therapy that are effective for treating anxiety. 

Types of Mental Health Professionals 

There are various types of mental health professionals who are trained to diagnose 
and treat anxiety disorders. Psychologists, psychiatrists, counselors, and clinical 
social workers are among the most common providers. Each profession has its own 
training and expertise, and the choice of provider depends on individual 
preferences and needs. Hypnotists cannot diagnose an anxiety disorder since it’s 
out of the scope of their practice. However, Hypnotists can work alongside mental 
health professionals to help client feel better. 

When to Seek Therapy 

Therapy may be recommended when anxiety symptoms significantly interfere with 
daily functioning or quality of life. Common indicators that therapy may be 



beneficial include persistent worry or fear, avoidance of anxiety-provoking 
situations, difficulty coping with stress, and impaired relationships or work 
performance. Seeking therapy is a proactive step toward addressing anxiety and 
improving overall well-being. 

It's always best not to wait until the symptoms are crippling and prevent one from 
functioning in everyday life. Seek professional help if your symptoms have lasted 
for more than 3 months or if the symptoms are so intense that they affect your 
health, sleep, relationships or work. 

Chapter 12: Building Resilience 

Resilience is the ability to bounce back from adversity and navigate life's challenges 
with strength and flexibility. In this final chapter, we will explore the concept of 
resilience, resilience-building activities, and strategies for embracing imperfection 
and uncertainty. 

Understanding Resilience 

Resilience is not a fixed trait but rather a dynamic process that can be cultivated 
and strengthened over time. Resilient individuals possess a set of adaptive coping 
skills, positive beliefs about themselves and the world, and a supportive network 
of relationships that help buffer against stress and adversity. By fostering resilience, 
individuals can navigate life's ups and downs with greater ease and confidence. 

Resilience-Building Activities 

There are many activities and practices that can help individuals build resilience 
and enhance their ability to cope with stress and adversity. Engaging in activities 
such as physical exercise, mindfulness meditation, journaling, and spending time 
with loved ones can promote emotional well-being and strengthen resilience. 
Cultivating a sense of purpose and meaning in life, fostering optimism and 
gratitude, and practicing self-compassion are also important resilience-building 
strategies. 

Embracing Imperfection 



It's important to recognize that resilience does not mean being immune to stress 
or never experiencing difficulties. Resilient individuals acknowledge their 
vulnerabilities and imperfections while recognizing their inherent worth and value. 
Embracing imperfection involves letting go of unrealistic expectations, practicing 
self-compassion, and learning from setbacks and failures. By embracing 
imperfection, individuals can cultivate greater resilience and adaptability in the 
face of life's challenges. 

By cultivating resilience through resilience-building activities, embracing 
imperfection, and fostering a sense of purpose and meaning, individuals can 
navigate life's challenges with greater confidence, strength, and optimism. 

Write down here the steps you will take starting TODAY to deal with anxiety: 

1. 

2. 

3. 

I hope you found this e-book useful, please let me know if you have any comments 

or suggestions by contacting me: 

 My website: www.fabiolamiguel.com 

Email: info@fabiolamiguel.com 

 

PLEASE SHARE THIS E-BOOK WITH SOMEONE WHO MIGHT NEED IT AND 

REMEMBER THAT……. 

 

“Anxiety is a future that only exists in your imagination” 

http://www.fabiolamiguel.com/
mailto:info@fabiolamiguel.com

